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Leave The Vineyard, turn right and immediately turn right again onto the 
road. Keep walking along it for about 0.3 miles (500m) until the ‘Misty
Meadow Farm’ signpost (there is a ‘Public Footpath’ signpost too). Turn left
onto a small road and after 50 yards (50m) go through the gate with the sign
‘Footpath’ on the right (1). Follow the trail in between the fields to the corner
and continue along it into the forest. Carry on through the forest (over two
bridges and through one metal gate) until the second gate. Walk through it,
climb over the following style and continue along the edge of the field until a
metal gate leading into the farm. Go through it and follow the trail for about
50 yards (50m) further until a post with yellow arrows on the right. 
Turn right and keep walking along the edge of the field and later continue 
straight through it. Go through a metal gate with a yellow arrow (2), down 
the slope, over a small bridge and up the opposite slope. Climb over the 
style, cross a small road and go up a few steps (follow a ‘Public Footpath’ 
signpost). Keep walking straight along the edge of the field until a wooden 
gate (3). Walk through it, turn right and continue along the edge of the field 
to the corner, turn left and keep walking down the hill along the next edge. 
Go through a metal gate and continue straight along the trail in between the 
trees. Later go through the next metal gate and follow the edge of the fields 
until the corner by a building. Walk through the metal gate, join a small road 
and keep walking straight until a bigger road. 

Turn right onto the bigger road and keep walking along it for about 0.3 miles 
(500m) until a crossroad with a bigger road and traditional signpost (4). Turn 
right onto the road and continue along it for about 0.2 miles (300m) until a 
‘Public Footpath’ stone on the left (it might be a little bit of a challenge to 
find it as it may be hidden in the bushes). Turn left and follow the trail 
diagonally through the field to the opposite corner and climb over the style 
into another field. Continue straight along the trail, through a small wooden 
gate and down the hill along the fence. 
Turn left onto the road and immediately behind the gate of ‘Furnace Mill’ (for 
more information see The Vineyard Walk - no. 2) turn right and walk through 
a small white gate (5). Keep walking along the edge of the field and over a 
metal bridge into the next field. Follow the edge of this field until the corner 
(you can see a track leading next to it). Turn right onto the track and keep 
walking along it for about 0.25 miles (400m) (later it becomes a tarmac road) 
until a small set of steps on the left. 

Walk up the steps and continue straight along the trail through the vineyards
for about 0.4 miles (600m). At the end go down a few steps and turn right
onto a road. Follow the road for about 50 yards (50m) until a crossroad with
small roads. Turn right and keep walking along the small road until The
Vineyard. 


